EXTRAORDINARY Registered No. M324

The Sindh Gobernment Gazette

Published by Authority

KARACHI TUESDAY DECEMBER 28, 2021

PART-1V

PROVINCIAL ASSEMBLY OF SINDH
NOTIFICATION
KARACHI, THE 28™ DECEMBER, 2021.

NO.PAS/LEGIS-B-42/2021-The Sindh Civil Courts (Amendment) Bill, 2021
having been passed by the Provincial Assembly of Sindh on 11" December, 2021
and assented to by the Governmor of Sindh on 17" December, 2021 is hereby

published as an Act of the Legislature of Sindh.
THE SINDH CIVIL COURTS (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2021

SINDH ACT NO. XXXIX OF 2021.

AN
ACT

to amend the Sindh Civil Courts Ordinance, 1962.

WHEREAS it is expedient to amend tnhe Sindh Civil Courts Preamble.

Ordinance, 1962, in the manner hereinafter appearing;

It is hereby enacted as follows:-

1. (1) This Act may be called the Sindh Civil Courts (Amendment) Act, 2021, Short title and
commencement.

Liv - 137 Ext-1V -39 (104) Price Rs.10.00



PART-IV THE SINDH GOVT. GAZETTE EXT. DEC. 28, 2021 10S

" (2) It shall come into force at once.

3 In the Sindh Civil Courts Ordinance, 1962, hereinafter referred
to as the said Ordinance, in section 7 -

(a) for the words “fifteen million”, the words “sixty five
million” shall be substituted; and

(b) in the proviso, for the figures “2010” the figures Sl
shall be substituted.

3 In the said Ordinance, in section 24, for the words “fifteen
million” wherever occurring, the words “sixty five million” shall be
substituted.

Amendment of
section 7 of West
Pakistan Ordinance
No.II of 1962."

Amendment of
section 24 of West
pakistan Ordinance
No.II of 1962.

BY ORDER OF THE SPEAKER
PROVINCIAL ASSEMBLY OF SINDH

G.M.UMAR FAROOQ

SECRETARY

PROVINCIAL ASSEMBLY OF SINDH

Karachi: Printed at the Sindh Government Press

28-12-2021



