EXTRAORDINARY

Registered No. M 324

W

The Bindh Governtvent Gajefte

Published by Authority

KARACHI SATURDAY, MARCH, 27, 1999

.-

PART-1
GOVERNMENT OF SINDH
LAW DEPARTMENT
NOTIFICATION

Karachi the 27" March,1999

No. S.LEGIS.1(7)/99 The following ordinance made by the Governor of Sindh is hereby published

for general information:-

g THE SINDH IRRIGATION (Amendment) ) -
ORDINANCE, 1999

SINDH ORDINANCE NO. VII, 1999

AN
ORDINANCE
to amend the Sind Irrigation Act, 1879 and
to provide for the abatement of certain orders relating

to distribution of irrigation water in the Province.

L(iv)-321-Ext-1-74-F (189-2) | Price: 1.30 Paisas



1 89-4a-THE SINDH GOVT. G EXT, MARCH, 27, 1999 {PART-

Preamble

Short title
and commence-
ment.

Amendment 6f
gection &

and 62 of Act
VII Of 1879. '

WHEREAS in order to enanra i B e
distribution of irrigation w ter-in the I'rovinece,
it is expedieht to amend the “ind Irrisation Act,
1879 and to annul certain ordera ralating o 1in-

tribution of irrigation water;

AND WHEREAS the Provineinl Ascembly ir nat
in session and the Governor of !indh ir antinfind
that circumstances exist which render il necessniy
to take immediate actionj

NOW, THEREFORE, in exercise of fhe powers
oconferred by clause (1) of Article 128 of the Cons-
titution of the Islamic Republic of Pnkistan, the

. Governor of Bindh is pleased to make and promvlgate

e

| *
|

|
|
|

the following Ordinance :-

1« (1) This Ordinance may be called the Nindh Irri-
gation (Amendment) Ordinance, 1999,

(2) It shall odme into force on and from Kharif
1999.

24 In the Bind Irrigation Act, 187Y, herein-
after referred to as the saia Act, in section 61,for
the words "three months", the words "two years" and
for the words "one thousand rupees", the words®three

L th.usund rupees" shall be substituted,

3 In the said Act, in section 62, for the words

. "one year", the words "three years" and for the words

"two thousand rupees", the words "five thousand rupees'
ghall be substituted,



e

PART I} THE SIND

In the said Act, after sechinn H2-A,

the following new section shall he ingerted:~

(1)

(2)

ng2-B ~Non-bailable | An offence
offence. punishable
under section or 62 shall be

non-bailable,".

Notwithstanding anything contained
in any law for the time being in force
or any Jjudgement or order of any court
or agreement, the orders granting

irrigation water through the yarious

canals to the various persons mentioned

in the Schedule to this Ordinance shall

stand abrogated and annulled and be

of no effect.

No compensation shall be claimed
by or payable to any person who

sustains any loss by such abroga-

tion and annullment,

AZETTE EXT, MARCH, 27, 1999- 189-4B

Abatement of
certain orders
o1 sanctions.



| $9-4c THE SINDH GOVT. GAZETTE EXT CH. 27. 1999 {PART-I

SCEEITIE
(8ee sectiss 5)

{ Are> [ MNo. and dt.
Acrea | of sanction
order —

Name of chaaanl
from vhore nev’
sept.outlet is
sanction & RD

Name of Applicant

f
|
|
|

S[HKI(UIS13AJ1R¢§QHZIIF1EI§L_

&'e ¥/s Uzair Tehseen Malwah Distry 223a0 2/938-50(0P) -

: and others RD 41.078 ac. ’;.,.1997
2. M/s Muhammad Alam Dhajoro Minor 287-0 2/812-50(0p) -97
¥.!  Khan and others RD 15.5 dt.6.10.1957
E%; 'M/s Ali M. Thebo  Kehi Minor 171-0 2/929-80(0P) -57
Ml Jand others. - | RD 12.10 dt.7.1.1998
T .

4. M/s Haji M. Aslam Jamrao Canal 327-0 2/909-S0(OP) ~57
gg: ~and others : RD 523 dt.15.1.1998

: ~2:"b;:-nabdu1 Ghaffar Dad Branch 113-0 2/689-S0(0OP) -94

RD 60.00 dt.20.1.1998
Abiji Minor 78-0 2/628-50(0P) -54
RD 19.855 dt.20.1.1998
Kurgaim Minor 55-0 2/630-SO(0OP) -S54
RD 3.655 d-.20.1.1998
Gachero Minor 43-0 2/631-50(0P) 94
RD 5.070 dt.20.1.1998
‘Let Minor . 86-0 2/632-SO(OP)-94
RD .35.151 dt.20.1.1998
.‘n '4,
"Gachero Minor 75-0 2/633-80(0P) %4
1’\5‘3.1::;&. RD 6.770 dt.20.1.1998
q ’i‘-{?. .fé\ xawaz'uemon ‘Abiji Minor 39-0 2/634-50(0P) 94
A "‘%‘hfbohtlf of Jatoi RD 19.115 dt.20.1.1998
Gachero Minor 25-0 2/635-SO(0OP) -54

RD 7.400 dt.20.1.1998



\‘em S QM\,

T S il

B0 A% . AN

PART I SINDH GOVT. GAZETTE EXT, MARCH, 27, 1999 -184- 4D
— e — - ; —_ ——ﬂ]
f Sr | Name of applicant Name of channel | Area No.and |
i No from where new acres | date of |
; X geparate outlet is ganction 1
i sanctioned & RD 7 order f
13. M/s M.Younis Mir Rukkan Minor 72-0 2/733-50(0P)-97
Hothipota & others RD 3.660 dt.21.1.1998
14. M/s Shamshad Ahmed Rohri Main Capnal 350-0 2/953-80(0P) 27
and others RD 1030 dt.21.1.1998
15. M/s Arbab Zakaullah Run Distry 294-0 2/946- .ﬂ;(uP) /97
and others. RD 108 dec.23.2.1998
I',ls. Haji Faiz Mohammad Tarah Distry 3B-0 2/922-80(0P) /497
i Shaikh RD 4.380 dt.15.9.1997
17 M/s Fazal Ahmed Wagherji Disty 153-0 2/887-SO(0P) /97
2 - Jat and others RD 10.3 Qt . RIS T957
“18. M/s Muhammad Tayab Khipro Canal 596-0 2/841-SO(OP) /96
£ and others. RD 147 29.9.1997
® )
#19. M/s Ghulam Rasool Gajrah Branch 3525-0- 2/890-SO(0P) /97
' ' and others RD 50-760. dt.1,10.1987
R , :
/20. Syed Mohd Shah Digri Distry 159-03 2/854-S0(0P) /96
Lk« + and others RD 53.0 dt.3.10.1997
ks :
é‘f?ll. 'M/s Haji: Mir Mohd Naukot Branch 226-0 2/961-80(0P) /98
;i\: : & Arbab Faiz Mohd RD 10.600 23.2.1998
b
‘22, Arbab Naimatullah Run Distry 11-07 . 2/894-SO(OP) /97
'T 1B 8 : \ RD 36.03 dt.6.3.1958
‘!:-'Lt.“ o'y & ‘,‘:" ] :.
"{;3 Ar‘bab ‘Naimatullah Run Distry 55-07 2/895-80(0P) /97
%?i’;"‘."".r.;c ; vz RD 9.3 6.3.1998
'b-'f::':' i i v .
4. Ghulam Mustafa Sher Khan 112-0 2/914-S0(0P) 97
%y ' &'others Minor dt.14.4.98
f‘} j Lo | RD 16.080
%:3:' B . g
2} « Mr. Ghulam Mustafa Sher Khan Minor 63-00  2/915-SO(OP) /97
£ - 8/c Mohd Moosa, RD 12.630 dt. 15.4.1998
K Arian ,
(F l_y
g é Mrr. Abdullah Run Distry - 59-00 = 2/925-SO(0P) /97
*. Tkt B /O Dado Nohri RD 44-790 C DT. 2.5.1998
r ﬂ
"7.. Syed Muzaffar Noorwah 236-00  2/977-80(0P) /90
W;.,;m;;in Shah Ad & T NS



28. Haji Mohd Alam
Jamali

it and others.

'29. M/s Nawab Ali

and others.

Rais Ghulam Nabi
Dhari

.~H/a Nuhanmaa
"-Sulcman Shaikh
und othera.‘

‘,..

8
" and others.

M/5 Sian Bux Korai
 and othcrl.

vr' v
uuhshnnd !akbob
snbki on behalf
' of Anawarullah
. Khan Jatoi.

Bux and othert.

LV SNV

Name of channel
from where new

separate outlet is

Area
acres

gsanctioned & RD

Brandhi Minor
RD 14.1

Shhor Wah
RD 19.500

Chanari NDistry
RD 13,700

Saeedabad Disty
RD 23.411

Run Distry
RD 20.775

Lundki Minor
RD 25.630

" Dad Branch

RD 35.480

Dad Branch
RD 35.532

Phull Distry
RD 75.081

Naseer Distry
RD 36.500

Doso Distry
RD 53,950

I—————

No.and ‘
date of
sanction
order,

235-0 2/923-8S0(0P) /98
dt. 5.5.1998
172-0  2/943-S0(0P) /97
Dt.2.6.1998
112-0  2/910-S0(OP) /97
dt. 4.6.1998
§7-0  2/908-S0(0P) /97
dt.3.7.1998
191-0 2/1005-SO(OP)98

297-0

956-0

413-0

< 352-0

230-0

507-0

dt. 3.7.1998

2/992-80(0P) /98
dt.4.7.1998

2/967-80(0P) /98
dt. 4.7.1998

2/966-S0(0P) /98
dt. 4.7.1998

2/864-80(0P) /96
dt.15.7.1998

2/858-80(0P) /96
dt. 17.8.1998

2/995-80(0P) /98
dt. 25.8.1998



39.

Syed Bachal Shah

40. Haji Mohd Aslam
Shaikh

i@l. Haji Muhammad

g' Ismail

8

{42% Ghulum Haider

14 ‘Burdi

43. Haji Shahmir

} Khan Rahu

}

44. Magbool Ahmed

& Jamali

45. M/s Hidayatullah

= and others.

+46. M/s Hidayatullah

Dahri and others

7.)iM/s Ali Hassan

~ 'Khan and others

M/s Mukhtiar Ali

-3_‘Mughati.‘

1 ’.a X
-,

SRR T

{"Mt'{ Una: on behalf

Name of éhannel

from where new
separate outlet ins

sanctioned_& uD

RD 354.185

Hyderabad Br. 51-0
RD 52.2 3
Fatehpur Distry 52-0
RD 11.723
Rain Distry 431-0
RD 27.500
Faiz Gunjwah 365-0
RD 112.200
Tarah Distry 86-00
RD 69.1 ’
Manhoro Minor 1353-00
RD 12.600
Kotwah 134-00
RD 29.205
Daulatpur Distrvy 96-00
RD 41.800
Dalipoto Minor 280-00
RD 25.846
Patuja Distry 184-00
RD 41.856
Let Minor 110-27
RD 22.508

- Jamrao Canal 1065-24

.No.and
date of
sanction
order

«/1013*S0(0P) /98
de. 26.8.,1998

2/911-S0(OP) /97 |
dt.26.8.1998 |

2/955-80(0P) /97
de. 27.8.1998

2/897-80(0P) /97
de. 1,9.1998

2/614-SO(OP) /94 |
dt. 2.9.1998

2/976-S0(0P) /98
dt. 2.9.1998

2/811-SO(OP) /96
dt, 3.9.1998

2/101-80(0OP) /98
dt. 5.9.19898.

2/934-S0(0P) /97
dt. 7.9.1998

2/951-80(0P) /87
dt. 7.9.1958

2/983-s0(0P) /98
dt. 7.9.1988

2/836-80(0P) /97
dt. 9.9.1998



“51. M/s Ghulam Ali
; ayd others. -
'52. M/s Dost Muhammad

3 and others

M/8 Ali Anwar
Brohi and others

M/8 Nobat Zardari
- and othe:s
. y

"x/- Niaz' Butaain
* and others

Sardax Abdul
-Hamid Khan xhoco

- M/s ubhd'lhln e
; unhar ‘and oth-ru

‘ Ve xu§.££.:-31sw
£ 3 Bnghio
UL e

i '7’3-'14&- ‘aii Anmed |

Lhand others

B, ST YE S T

7 sanccioned & RD !

Name of channel
from where new
separate outlet is

Shahpur Distry ' 488-00
RD 22.506 o

Gachero Minor 144-00
RD 5.934

Nasrat Branch 386-00
RD 230-15%

Daulatpur Distry 347-00
RD 26.575

Sanesa Minor 40-00
RD 3.520

Obhai Chan Minor 167-00
RD 17.696

Fatehpur Distry B6-00
RD 15.698

Suikandar Distr:- 9-00
RD £1.00

Thar Canal ''997-00
RD 50.100

Johi Branch 206-0

RD 34.520

Sukhpur Minor 35-0

RD 28.83

James Minor 318-0

RD 16.98S

Xokol Branch 115-0

‘RD 20.996

No.and

date of

sanction
order

2/821-s0(0P) /96

dt. 12.9.1998

2/935-50(0P) /97
dt.12.9.1998

2/651-50(0P) /98
dt.14.5.1996

2/819-S0(0P) /26
dt.15.9.1998
2/888-80(0P) /97
dt.24.9,1998
2/1019.-80(0P) /98
dt.24.9.1998
2/1007-80(0F) 58
dt. 30.5.1598

2/960-80(OP) /97
dt. 3.10.1998

2/944-80(0P) /87
dt. 22.10.1588

2/794-8S0(0P) /96
dt., 29.10.1598

2/1009-5S0(0P) 98
dt.” 29.10.88

2/1021-50(CP) /98
dt. 29.10.15986

2/1029-50(0P) /98
dt. 29.10,1998



%64. Mr. Mushtaq Ahmed Shah Latif Minor
3 Nizamani RD 21.9
EGS.; Malik Allauddin Nasir Branch
; RD 55.3
:
4
., GUDU BARRAGE REGION
Bk o
| 66. Syed Ali Akbar WC 33AL 163-00
k@j \gnd others Ex.Kaziwah
7. J;Mblvivhsadullah Mubarakpur
;j'wrulhar-lnd others Minor
i RD 90.0 _
4 KOTRI BARRAGE REGION
Ly 1 >

,"

+ e

AR

-
B

) 5

.

:"!
g?
ey
LY
iz

o

'}1‘

i & Pocrun &'
'lﬁﬁgiﬁlra _.?
g :

P V5 Jkies o
> \!.:\_“. :\_-_’:?.)‘ 4
0

M- b VRS
: ¥

Name of channel
from where new
separate outlet is

sanctioned & RD

$hesy
' Naseer Branch 2-00
- of Fuleli

1%+ cangl RD 77.0

e M Faiaalzahnn Rajwah 133-00
ahigisbff:.i 4 RD 15,5
V'wé(g E ..'.‘-:‘.' ".: \'\A\' =2
., v 2 i ‘.‘:’:j
"'*“~Hujf»uond ‘Rabim '  Pinyari 489-00
¥, G“ N 1 Feeder Lower
RD 141.07
‘. Shahawais 317-00
. Canal
3 ',L RD 9 . 60
< . )
ame Muradwah 743-00
hers. RD 64.00
Sutlani Br. 1105.00

RD 84.00

EXt-I-74-G

163-0"

883-0

date of
sanction
order

2/973-80(0P) /97
dt. 30.10.1998

8/1638-50(0P) /97
de. 5.6.1998,

24/951-80 (0P~
II)/96
dt.22.12.199%7

1146-0 24/953-S0(OPII) /97
dt.

14.10.1997

7/2001-SO{H&R) /37
dt. 24.12.1997«

7/2065-50 (H&R) /97
dt. 7.9.1998

7/2044-SO(H&R) /97
dt. 8.,5.1998

7/2081-S0(H&R) /97
de. 6.7.1998

7/1964-SQ (H&R) /96
dt. 14.9.1998

7/2127-SO(H&R) /98
dt.15.9.1998.,



74.

15.

76.

T

4

Syed Ghulam Abbas
Shah

Hur Commander
Mohd  Ismail
Gadiwan & others.

Haji Mohib Ali
Leghari & others

M/s Ahmed Khan
Rahmoon & others

“M/s Muzaffar
" Hussain Mari
- and others.

“Fakir Mohd and
‘others.

~ M/s Ghulam Qambar

Bahri and others

.
.
f——e -

Name of channel | Area | No.and ﬂ
from whare new acres | date of ‘
separate outlet is | sanction |
gcanctioned & yu L ’Lordex |

——— -

"

K.B,Feeder * 88-00
RD 57.00

Shadi Wah 1425-00
Small RD 11

Murad Wah 225-00
RD B6.3

Suni Guni Br. 219.00

RD 111.00

SUKKUR BARRACE

West Branch 1050-0

RD 42-0

Lundki 220-00
Distry

RD 19.074

Daulatpur 195-00
Distry

RD 47.611

== —

7/1836-50 (H&R) /35
dt. 19.9.1998

7/2097-S0 (H&R) /97
dt. 24.9.1998

7/1646-S0 (H&R) /92
dt.25.9.1998.

7/2020-50 (H&R) /97
de. 6.12.1997,

2/982-80(0P) /98
dt.30.10.1998
(Already
cancelled).

2/962-S0(0P) /98
dt.30.10.98

2/804-80(0P) /96
dt. 18.6.19%§



applicant

Transferred
from

Transferred | No. & dt
to of
sacntion

e R — —
e

M/s Mohd Piral 297-0
Burdi and

S.Qurban Ali 217-0
Shah & others

Haji Mizra 8-0

Khoso

- M/s Abdul Khaliq 102-0
Sanjrani & others

Makhdoom §5-0
Sikandar Ahmed

Siddique;

WC 6-AL
and 7-T
Ex.Pir
Wassan
Minor.

WC 6-L
Ex.Mell
Minor

WC 3-L
Ex.Dad

Branch

WC 45-L
Ex.Runo
Minor

WC 5-AR,
6-R Ex.
Sita
Minor

SUKKUR BARRAGE REGION

WC 20-R Ex 3/417-S0(OP) 97
Faiz Gunj dt. 3.9.1998
Wah

WC BA,1-AR 3/428-S0(0P) S8
Ex.West Br dt. 5.9.1998°

3/423-50(0P) 98

WC 11-AL

Ex.Manglo dt. 17.9.1998
WC LS/2-R 3/415-S0(0P)S§7
E» .Jamrao dt. 18.9.1997
WC1-L Ex. 3/419-50(0P)S7
Wetting dt. 15.9.1997
Channel

& D.O.

509 Ex.

Dadu Canal

:



1zrwm!!ﬂE_l!ﬂ!_JES!!]lSh1Z!Z[11L!!EI;!Ls!ﬂﬂﬂal_;_22ailﬂlﬂEi

No

frrsececcctcncccccme s

SUKKUR BARRAGE Rﬁ ION

y86 Tarique Fateh
and others

. M/s Mohd Moosa
Nohri & others

7"8“:
~3

o

M/s Noor Mohd
Pally and others

&8. Munawar Ali
.+ Bhughhari

§ and others.

59. M/s Umed Ali
?7 and others

L

1. uohd Moosa Nohri
,“‘4ind S

? 2uﬁhd Dawood
an& ‘others

Abdul Wahid
;mﬂ‘xachéllo .;‘
X :}s nd/ 3

4.”u4aﬂ,ar$
. Velhari and' hia
family‘nembora.

5

> Mbhd kafi
Kachello

u,xna;QEqaza...ﬁn

o8- Qso‘»-' b ¥

'fﬂ 41 '258/IAR Distry
0 «258/1!!
272/1AL

gs. Name of applicant

\"!F lv}w

- -

Water
course

Channel

6-L
9-AL

320/
1-AL

11-1,
2-L

8-AR
" 4-AR

W.C

272/

IB.
10-R

259/
B'R'

i, 25973

Ashabo
Minor

Bustan
Distry

Jamrao
Canal

Akuto
Distry

Thar
Canal

Rehmore
Distry

Dilore
Minor

Puran
Distry

Nagnah
Distry

Puran
Distry

270/3L, 270/3

292/3,
-L

27212

292/3L

272/1A Puran

Rajwah
Distry

Area

acres

7-05

18-15

g8-0

22-16

46-20

22-00

14-20 -

6-0

44-32

247-10

96-0

24-0

No. and dato
nanction

- - - e - --———-

16/2078<80(0OFP) 96
dt.19.752997 .

16/2118-80(0P) 57
at, 17.31383897

16/‘136 SO(0P) 57
dt.2.1,.1998

16/1752~-80(0P) 83
dt. 21.1.1998

16/2103-50(0P) 96
de. 21.1.1998

16/2121-SO(0P) 97
dt. 22.1.1998

16/2116-50(0P) 37
dt.23.5,1998

16/2162-80(0P) 98
dt. 2.9.1998

16/2145-S0(0P) /98
dt. 4.8.1998.

16/2160-SO(0OP) 98
dt.2.9.1998
16/2160-80(0P) 98
dt.12.10.1998

16/2161-80(0P) 98
dt.2.9.1988
16/2161-80(0OP) 98
dt.12.10.1998

7/2059-80 (H&R) 97
de.22.5.1998



N. _ acre sahction of canc:
F-«--o--_ao-o--:-.-.-p-a--_-----;«ro:-p-.___ e s s cccmaressss
12594
98 Ameet Kumar West Br. 705=2 2/681-
: and others RD 5.3 1 SO(OP)70
Vol.III
dated
30.9.97
2/687-
SO (OP) 70
dated
30.9.97
00. ¥/s Sardar West 185-0 2/687-
s Ahmed Moghal Branch sSo(op) 70
and RD 39 dated
30.5.97
3-An  20-0 B/319-  8/319-
* ~ Ex.Thar so(op)84 sO(oP) 84
- canal dated dated
18.12. 85 11.6.96
' Area No.& dt. No.& dt Area
Sanct- of o{ rest-
ioned @sanction cancell ored
tion
16/985- 2/687- B-0
BO(OP)9C so(oP)70
: Vol.IX

27.8.90

No,

2/485-
SO (op) 92

dated
21,9.98

2/200-~
SO(0P) BS
dated
4.3.98

3/347-
SOo(oP)S3

dated
3.7.58

8/319-

~ so(op) B4

dated
27997

& dt.
of
restored

16/985-
S0 (0P) 90
dated
21.1.98



{89-AM - THE SINDH GOVT. GAZETTE EXT, MARCH. 27, 1999 {PART-I

& amali

o

%03. Haji Imam Bux

i »

——s

104. Mohd Igbal
" Nizamani and
; others.

ey
™
"
s
b}
4

'.
At
AR
S, L .

05, Moh Rahim Gaho

Eawitng

Name of Ch. on
which pumping
machine sanctioned
and RD

KOTRI BARRAGE

Akram Wah 1371

RD 114 L/S

Akram Wah
RD 145 L/s

Gulel Minor
RD 24.0 L/8

* un-commanded.

172-0

150-0w

.....

No. and date
of sanction

7/2051-S0(H&R) 97
dated 7.8.19%97

7/1939-8S0 (H&R) 96
dated. 2.9.1998

7/697-80 (H&R) 79
dt. 21.9.98



loosnmnocsactebodenseonesessssssanppasersnesssasbssanns

5

T RCH 999 ) 89-AN

S.No. Name of channel and RD Area
from where new channel acres
cff-takes.

O OO e RSP eSO A saEEE RS -as -

107. Water course 121/3-5L . -
x4 Ex.Jamrao Canal converted
into Government channel.

i M——

- P ——

e

No. and date of
sanction

24/954-80(0P-1IIX) /87
dated 20.6.15998

5/110-80(0P) /95
dated 23.4.1997

Karachi Lt. Gen Moin Ud din Haider (Retd)
HI(M)
Governor of Sindh
Dated the 27* March, 1999, '
GHULAM NABI SHAH
Secretary Law Department

Karachi Printed at the Sindh Government Press

(1250)27-03-1999-Offset



