
 

SIND ORDINANCE NO. III OF 1983 
 

THE SIND MINISTERS (SALARIES, ALLOWANCES AND PRIVILEGES)ACT,1975 
( THE SINDH MINISTER (SALARIES, ALLOWANCES AND PRIVILEGES)(AMENDMENT) ORDINANCE, 1983 
 
 

 

[19
th

  February, 1983] 

 

          An Ordinance to amend the Sind Ministers (Salaries, 

Allowances and Privileges) Act, 1975 
  

 

         WHEREAS it is expedient to amend the Sind Ministers 

(Salaries Allowances and Privileges) Act, 1975, in the manner 

hereinafter appearing; 
 

Preamble. 

         NOW, THEREFORE, in pursuance of the Proclamation of the 

fifth day of July, 1977 and the Provincial Constitution Order, 

1981, the Governor of Sind is pleased to make and promulgate 

the following Ordinance :- 

 

 

1. (1) This Ordinance may be called the Sind Ministers (Salaries, 

Allowances and Privileges) (Amendment) Ordinance, 

1983. 
 

   (2) It shall come into force at once and shall be deemed to 

have taken effect on and from 1st January, 1983. 

 

Short Title 

And 

Commencement 

2.    In the Sind Ministers (Salaries, Allowances and Privileges) 

Act, 1975, hereinafter referred to as the Said Act, after section 3, 

the following shall be inserted I— 

 

 

 “3-A. A Minister shall, on his first appointment, be 

entitled to equipment allowance of three 

thousand rupees." 

 

3.   In the said Act, in section 5, for the word “shall 

respectively be three thousand rupees and two thousand five 

hundred rupees per mensem” the words “shall be three 

thousand rupees per mensem” shall be substituted. 

 

4.   In the said Act, in section 6, for the words “one thousand 

rupees” the words “one thousand and five hundred rupees” 

shall be substituted. 

 

5.   In the said Act, after section 6, the following shall be 

inserted:-  

 

 

 “6-A A Minister may in his discretion make grants 

to the extent of seven thousand and five hundred 

rupees in a year.”  

 

6.   In the said Act, in section 7---- 

Insertion of 

section 3-A in 

Sind Act VIII of 

1975. 

 

 

 

 

 

Amendment of 

section 5 of Sind 

Act VIII of 1975. 

 

 

Amendment of 

section 6 of Sind 

Act VIII of 1975. 

 

Insertion of 

section 6-A in 

Sind Act VIII of 

1975. 

 

 

 

 

 

Equipment 

allowance 

 

Discretionary 

Grant 

 



 

SIND ORDINANCE NO. III OF 1983 
 

THE SIND MINISTERS (SALARIES, ALLOWANCES AND PRIVILEGES)ACT,1975 
( THE SINDH MINISTER (SALARIES, ALLOWANCES AND PRIVILEGES)(AMENDMENT) ORDINANCE, 1983 
 
 

 

 

(i) in sub-section (1) for the words “shall be provided 

with official Residence” the words “shall be 

provided with free furnished official residence” 

“shall be substituted; 

 

(ii) in sub-section (3), in clause (a), for word “thirty 

thousand rupees” the words “forty thousand 

rupees” shall be substituted. 

 

7.   In the said Act, after section 8, the following shall be 

inserted:-   

 

 

 

                   “8-A. A Minister shall be entitled to telephone 

facilities at his office and residence at 

Government expense without ceiling.” 

 

            8. In the said Act, the existing section 16 shall be 

renumbered as sub-section (1) of that section and thereafter 

the following shall be added:- 

 

                “(2) A Minister shall be entitled to receive leave salary 

of three thousand rupees per mensem”. 

 

                 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Insertion of 

section 8-A in 

Sind Act VIII of 

1975. 

 

 

 

 

 

Amendment of 

section 16 of Sind 

Act VIII of 1975. 

   

 


