SIND ACTNO.X OF 1985

THE SIND PARLIAMENTARY SECRETARIES (SALARIES,

ALLOWANCES AND PRIVILEGES) (AMENDMENT) ACT, 1985

An Act to amend the Sind Parliamentary Secretaries
(Salaries, Allowances and Privileges) Act, 1974.

WHEREAS it is expedient fo amend the Sind Parliamentary
Secretaries (Salaries, Allowances and Privileges) Act, 1974, in the
manner hereinafter appearing;

It is hereby enacted as follows.—

1. (1) This Act may be called the Sind Parliomentary
Secretaries (Salaries, Allowances and Privileges) (Amendment)
Act, 1985.

(2) It shall come into force at once.

2. In the Sind Parliamentary Secretaries (Salaries,
Allowances and Privileges) Act, 1974, hereinafter referred to as
the said Act, in section 3, for the words “one thousand and five
hundred rupees”, the words “three thousand rupees” shall be
substituted.

3. In the said Act, in section 4, for the words “one hundred
rupees”, the words “one hundred and twenty five rupees” shall
be substituted.

[8th January, 1986]

Preamble.

Short title and
commencement.

Amendment of
section 3 of Sind
Act XXIV of 1974.

Amendment of
section 4 of Sind
Act XXIV of 1974.



http://sindhlaws.gov.pk/setup/publications_SindhCode/PUB-15-000622.pdf
http://sindhlaws.gov.pk/setup/publications_SindhCode/PUB-15-000622.pdf
http://sindhlaws.gov.pk/setup/publications_SindhCode/PUB-15-000622.pdf
http://sindhlaws.gov.pk/setup/publications_SindhCode/PUB-15-000622.pdf
http://sindhlaws.gov.pk/setup/publications_SindhCode/PUB-15-000622.pdf
http://sindhlaws.gov.pk/setup/publications_SindhCode/PUB-15-000622.pdf

