PROVINCIAL ASSEMBLY OF SINDH
NOTIFICATION
KARACHI, THE 04™ JuLY, 2017

NO.PAS/L egis-B-15/2017-The Sindh Laws (Amendment) Bill, 2017 having been passed by
the Provincial Assembly of Sindh on 18" May, 2017 and assented to by the Governor of Sindh
on 19" June, 2017 is hereby published as an Act of the Legislature of Sindh.

THE SINDH LAWS (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2017
SINDH ACT NO. XXII OF 2017

AN
ACT

to amend certain laws in force in the Province of Sindh.

WHEREAS it is expedient to amend certain laws in force in Preamble.
the Province of Sindh;

It is hereby enacted as follows:-

1. (1) This Act may be called the Sindh Laws (Amendment) Act, Short title and
2017. Commencement.

(2) It shall come into force at once and shall be deemed to have
taken effect on and from 1% day of July, 2016.

2. In laws specified in column 2 of the Schedule below are
hereby amended to the extent and in the manner specified against
them in column 3 thereof.

SCHEDULE
S.NO. | SHORT TITLE OF THE AMENDMENT
LAWS
1. 2. 3.

1. The Sindh Assembly 1.In section 3, for the words “twenty four
Members (Salaries thousand”, the words “fifty thousand” shall be
and Allowances substituted.

Act,1974 (Act
No.XXVI of 1974). 2. In section 3-A, for the words “four thousand

eight hundred”, the words “ten thousand” shall
be substituted.

3. In section 3-B, for the words “sixteen thousand
rupees”, the words “forty five thousand” shall
be substituted.



The Sindh Speaker’s
and Deputy Speaker’s
(Salaries, Allowances
and Privileges) Act,
1975(Act No. VII of
1975).

. In section 3-C, for the words “four thousand

eight hundred”, the words “fifteen thousand”
shall be substituted.

. In section 4, for the words “eight hundred

eighty rupees” and for the words “six hundred
forty rupees”, the words “one thousand rupees”
shall be respectively be substituted.

. In section 4-B, for the words “two thousand

four hundred rupees”, the words “five
thousand” shall be substituted.

. In section 5-A —

(i) in sub-section (1), for the words “one
hundred and twenty thousand rupees”, the
words “two hundred thousand rupees” shall
be substituted;

(i) in sub-section (2), for the words “one
hundred thousand rupees”, the words “one
hundred and fifty thousand rupees” shall be
substituted.

. In section 6, in sub-section (1), for the words

“five thousand”, the words “ten thousand” shall
be substituted.

. In section 6-B, for the words “eight thousand”,

the words “fifteen thousand” shall be
substituted.

10. Compensation in case of Air or Road

Accident Rs. 50,00,000/= for Member of the
Provincial Assembly of Sindh.

1. In section 3-A, for the words “seven thousand”,

the words “fifty thousand” shall be substituted.

. In section 5, in sub-section (1), for the words

“eight thousand and seventy thousand”, the
words “one hundred fifty thousand and one
hundred forty thousand” shall respectively be
substituted.

. In section 6, in sub-section (2), for the words

“fifty five thousand three hundred” and the
words “forty nine thousand”, the words
“seventy thousand” and the words “sixty
thousand” shall respectively be substituted.



The Sindh Ministers
(Salaries, Allowances
and Privileges Act,
1975 (Act No. VIII of
1975).

. In section 7-A, for the words “five hundred

thousand rupees and three hundred thousand
rupees”, the words "“ten hundred thousand
rupees and five hundred thousand rupees” shall
respectively be substituted.

. In section 8, for the words eight thousand four

hundred”, the words “twenty thousand” shall be
substituted.

. In section 10, for the words “seven hundred

and seventy”, the words “two thousand” and
“one thousand and five hundred” shall be
substituted.

. Residence Maintenance Allowance (Instead of

Furnishing Government/ Private Residence)
Rs. 70,000/= for Speaker and Rs. 50, 000/=
for Deputy Speaker respectively per month.

. Compensation in case of Air or Road Accident

Rs. 50,00,000/= for Speaker and the Deputy
Speaker respectively.

. In section 3-A, for the words “fifteen thousand

rupees and five thousand rupees”, the words
“twenty thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

. For section 5, the following shall be

substituted:-

“5. Salary. The salary of the Chief Minister and
a Minister shall respectively be one hundred fifty
thousand rupees and seventy five thousand
rupees per mensem.

. In section 6, for the words “thirteen thousand

rupees and nine thousand rupees”, the words
twenty thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

. For 6-A, the following shall be substituted:-

“6-A. Discretionary Grant. An appropriate
amount and a sum of ten hundred thousand
rupees in a year shall be placed at the disposal
of the Chief Minister and five hundred thousand
rupees at the disposal of Minister per annum for
making discretionary grants in such manner as
may be prescribed.



5. In section 7, in sub-section (2), for the words
“thirty nine thousand”, the words “fifty five
thousand” shall be substituted.

6. In section 10, for the words “five hundred and
fifty rupees”, the words “twenty thousand
rupees and one thousand five hundred rupees
respectively” shall be substituted.

7. Residence Maintenance Allowance (Instead of
Furnishing Government/ Private Residence)
Rs. 70,000/= for Chief Minister and Rs. 50,
000/= for Minister respectively per month.

8. Compensation in case of Air or Road Accident
Rs. 50,00,000/= for Chief Minister and the
Minister respectively.

The Sindh Special 1. In section 5, for the words “seventeen
Assistants thousand”, the words “seventy thousand” shall
(Appointment, be substituted.

Powers, Functions,
Salaries, Allowances 2. In section 6, for the words “four thousand”, the

and Privileges) Act, words “ten thousand” shall be substituted.
2003 (Act No.I of
2005). 3. In section 8 —

(i) in sub-section (2), for the words “fifteen
thousand”, the words “thirty thousand”
shall be substituted;

(ii) after sub-section (2), the following new
sub-section shall be added:-

“(3) Where the Special Assistant is not
provided with an official residence or
prefers to reside in his own house or a
private residence, he shall be paid forty five
thousand rupees per mensem.”.

4. After section 8, the following new section shall
be inserted:-

“8-A Equipment Allowance. The Special
Assistant to Chief Minister, on his first
appointment, as such, receive an equipment
allowance of fifty thousand rupees.”.



5. After section 9, the following new section shall
be inserted:-

“9-A. Daily Allowance of duration halts.
(1). The Special Assistant, during the tour on
official duty, be entitled to draw a daily
allowance of rupees one thousand for the
duration of halts:

Provided that half Daily Allowance shall be
admissible for the day arrival, the day of
departure and the day of both arrival and
departure.”.

6. Residence Maintenance Allowance (Instead of
Furnishing Government/ Private Residence) Rs.
30,000/= for Special Assistant to Chief Minister
per month.

7. Compensation in case of Air or Road Accident
Rs. 50,00,000/= for Special Assistant to Chief
Minister

BY ORDER OF THE SPEAKER
PROVINCIAL ASSEMBLY OF SINDH

G.M.UMAR FAROOQ
SECRETARY
PROVINCIAL ASSEMBLY OF SINDH



